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Grenoble tournament
23.-24. January 2016

3rd edition of the Grenoble tournament, 
and 3rd participation for a Wahoo Zurich 
team. This year, the team was com-
posed of Katherine, Janine, Bettina, Ol-
ivier, Robin, Krishna, Martin and Cyril. 
Everybody left Zurich on Friday evening 
and surprisingly, Krishna’s car made it 
to Grenoble before Robin’s! Apparently 
the 7-seater was so comfortable its oc-
cupants purposely decided to extend 
their route by making a detour via Basel.

After a long night sleep, a heavenly-
good “all-you-can-eat” buffet breakfast 
and a usual Decathlon-supermarket 
stop, it was time for the tournament! 
First game started well with a 7-0 win 
against Pierrelatte-Grenoble, despite 
both Cyril and Olivier being sent to the 
sin bin. Next games were a 3-6 loss 
against Clermont, a 6-3 win against 
Grenoble2, a 3-3 tie against our friends 
from Annemasse/Geneva and finally a 
0-8 loss against Grenoble1 who eventu-
ally ended up winning the tournament.

hinten: Cyril, Daniel, Ivan, Robin, Olivier, Martin
vorne: Bettina, Katherine, Janine, Krishna, 
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After a nice steak dinner and a short 
night, the second day started again with 
a game against Pierrelatte-Grenoble, 
lost 2-3 this time. Next was a 1-9 loss 
against Grenoble1 but we felt proud 
enough just to score a goal against the 
winners of the tournament. Followed a 
8-3 win against the Moirans girls with 
a penalty shot conceded, a 1-6 loss 
against a reinforced Grenoble2 team, a 
clear 3-1 win this time to break the tie 
against Annemasse/Geneva, and finally 
a revenge win 3-2 against Clermont, 
with a penalty shot missed, fortunately 
without consequences.

In summary: 6 won, 4 lost, 1 tie, and an 
awesome spot on the third place of the 
podium. Overall it was a great tourna-
ment weekend with lots and long inter-
esting games against reinforced teams, 
playing penalty shots for the first time, 
in a challenging deep cold pool but 
very warm atmosphere, and last but not 
least, accompanied with nice French 
food. Hard to beat such a menu!

Olivier Ivan füttert Krishna
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«Wahoos are hungry!




